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Disclosure

INTRODUCTION
Disclosure
The defendant’s right to a fair trial is the essential rationale for drsdﬁsure hy NN

N,

the presecution. The defendant’s right to fair disclosure is an in egamb% par“/ (DJ\\/
of his or her right to 2 fair trial, €§

Disclosure is & process by which all relevant information athn %i by the <\
prosecution against the defendant in criminal proceedingsis ﬁ(ovrded;o the\ S
defendant, to enable the defendant to view the cas/e/agamst em and. \
prepare their defence. ¢ \/ N y \

As an Investigator, you will be involved in prosaéfﬁm\gé perqorn” ff?\bﬁ%eﬁt
fraud (or student allowance, and/or student-oar frj rf@ﬁ{r&;’tsf rom the
Ministry or Crown Law will provide Iega L/e reseh tion /f Eourt y

The person being prosecuted, usuafiy\a IS rrt/a/rzd/or” thalr%tner will be the
defendant(s). One of your roles Wﬂ%: to-prepare. andvshare the relevant
Ministry information and documents.g d@rgamse‘ah\e witnesses so that
prosacution runs smoothly, Vm  dlso e\séwor‘ to review
information disclosed by ;he, defend’ént / O \\/\/

Disciosure is a legal /raqmren%dt uﬂf;e*“ThQ C\f}mma Disclosure Act ZQGS.
RN ‘
THE cmmrggﬁ \scLQI E ACT 2008

The purposg b;ﬁ;t]ﬁe Crimi losure Act 2008 is to promote a fair, effective
and efficient disciosure ofy r*st information between the prosecution and
Qé, /and %xncm paﬁ:ﬁés for the purposes of criminal proceadings.

inal Di gle‘sqre/gﬁt 2008 does not limit or affect other enactments

Q,i{;:-ﬁgt ngto availabiity of information.
0 N
- /—\- / *k‘)\\\ :

\g\%‘he foll o mg” diagram provides a general overview of disciosure by
pro;e/\utm‘_te/the defendant.
% o
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Disclosure by prosecutor to defendant

Cririnal proczedings
commence
initial disciosure coours o~ //
{(gensraiy not laterthan < / ~ J\\
S RN
21 days afier commencement PR S \
of procesdings) \)\\\% ; O\
! & A /
‘é* s w( \/ <\\ :\\\\\\_,,/
. \4/ Ea ;
! Does defendant recuest mare | ws 9%“0\ \¢ <
| infermation from prossciter? i"’@” sortie el O N
. ~nformation . X
e i aras
’ NS A AN\
Full disclesure ceows { as/\ 9\\@ (O Y
soon as practicavie) afer. V> P/
defandan— 0 N
e pleade riot guil /(ﬁ\‘ A v VRS

e glgcts frial by 3[:@\ N f’ =,
& 1Irst appears t%ﬂu\r\{ifme (o
charge lmsfi mﬁmabﬁg} p !

N
I S Ny \\ P
\\if’ f\\\\\%\\\
//—“\\ \\_’-‘3. \\/
e

- \?ED%?! defenﬁam;ﬂ) wreram 1 ts entified to any

. closury frust be made
4 Agduest § rtbe?F nfu matmn other retayant

e \ ft )/f}
N
= ’\\

T Cj/ - under a

. \(/‘5’ Nﬁ\fmﬁrﬁrsﬂosme reguied withhaid
@\) \ \ BIT Prosecutnr T provisi z}n}
5 .

I infermation
l (other than

information that
can e withheld

<\ /’*\igH tisdesure m\g\ re us ed ithe defencant pleads guity iIngead of not gikvin s

charg %mﬁﬁ s&mma

\
ﬁm}%—a%osecutlon begins {often as the summons is being served, at the
' first appearance in court, or when charges are faid), but no longer

21 days after service of the summons upon the defeﬂdant you must

/f:cmpiete initial mandatory disclosure and disciose the foiiowmg information
320 the defendant:

\l//f - A Summary of Facts (which includes the maximum penalty, and the
minimum penalty (if one is provided for), for the offence and a list of
previous offences proved to have been committed by the defendant

- Asummary of the defendant’s right to apply for further information
before entering a plea
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- Aist of the defendant's previous convictions that are known to the
prosecutor

This initial mandatory disclosure is provided to the defendant (or their
lawyer) pursuant to section 12(1) Criminal Disciosure Act 2008.

After criminai proceedings start, the defendant can request in w )tmg the O
following information which must be disclosed to them as soondag > 9 /1 S \/
practicable under Section 12 (2) of the Criminal Disclosure Acst&t)@é g { \ \

(@) the names of any withesses whom the prosecutor n}t@st@ ésil at the%\\v’
hearing or trial; and (/\ \ S v

{b) a list of the exhibits that are proposad to be pmduced oh bmhaigafih
prosecution at the hearing or trial; and «<\ \/ /\7 \ Toe?

{€) a copy of all records of interviews with th@éf\dant a(g\\ >

{d) a copy of all records of interviews fop;ase\wtlon \s “by a law
enforcement officer that contain relava@t\‘afoﬁmatlo anx

(e) a copy of job sheets and othe{n@l’tés of ewden\:@,cp{ﬁpleted or taken by
taw enforcement officer mai: fE “\hﬁeie\:a*&\‘o@auon, anda

Lf} copy of any records of e\ﬂdérﬁ_/e pr D;.ms&s%\by)u testing device that
contain relevant mformaﬁ@\m and /

(g) a copy of any ”E;rams aﬁd p ﬁs made or taken by a law
enforcement office “ontai re vaﬂy lnfcrmat;on and are intended to
be mtroduced@s%mke e as party case for the prosecution; and

h)a v;de;a Qopy/ef /éﬂy Vit \1 \%:émew with the defendant; and

{i} a copy m@ ei?vant Rét\é@ﬁﬁncemmg compliance with the New Zealand
Bill of thé}\ct 1990; an

}opw of amy. st@ /ngent made by, or record of an interview with, a co-
E‘e ant iry é‘ﬁy. Where the defendants are to be proceeded against
Af her for m@@;e& offence; and

) a fi z“aN information described in paragraphs (a) to (j) that the
pr ei\c tcr{r\*e?’uses under section 15, 16, 17, or 18 to discicse to the

/zr/e P n%/ together with—
i

) the reason for the refusal; and

(if) if the defendant so requests, the grounds in support of that

() W reason, uniess the giving of those grounds would itself prejudice the

\‘:ﬂ

interests protected by section 16, 17, or 18 and (in the case of the
interests protected by section 18) there is no overriding public
inferest,
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FULL DISCLOSURE

If, during prosecution, & client pleads not guilty to an offence proceeded

against summarily, elects trial by jury or if the information has been laid

indictably, and made his or her first appearance in Court in relation t\o the
offence(s), the prosecutor must complete full disclosure, Full d;sclo/@;n‘

involves the prosecution providing copies of all 'relevant’ inform m\a\ﬁoﬁ&oﬁw ff?

defence. o ,«5\/ " /
Relevant means information or an exhibit that tends to s ;ﬁc?t or rebut, ot\“p\
has material bearing on, the case against the defendan® /“Fhé types f{

information that must be provided as part of full di ;ﬂb‘swe in iudeg\ \

{a) a copy of any statement made by a prosecyizro w@ Hess; a/nd\\ : \>

(b} a copy of any brief of evidence that has bEefvépgparedNélatabm to a
prosecution witness; and /< N

/S
(¢) the name and, if disclosure is authbﬁs\\{néar sectzon@ the address of
any person mtemewed by the prc;s\ec&tc} ijo gave \rék,s\f@ information and
whom the prosecutor does not /; ﬁemi o call as @@tﬁ\,ss and—

i) any written account of‘t\he’* tﬂmz\.yb}fm ether signed or unsigned,
and any other rec(ojf\cﬁﬁthe Jntemex\fg“ an@

(i) any statemeht r?ade/’m th/e /prt}s&’ytor by the person; and

(d) any convictions of & \pfesecu q}tﬂ& s that are known to the prosecutor
and that may aﬁej&me\zredlbmmdf that witness; and

(e} a list aﬁéﬁ*@xiﬁbﬁs th ‘shégp%s&cumr proposas to have introduced as

avidenc /\f}f the m e prosecution; and
(f) a fist \/a«%}r@ievanr exhibits in the possession of the prosecutor that the

ppasecutm doas né’c\;{ropose to have introduced as avidence: and

P é?\a Copy of a/\\\,f@vratlon supplied to the prosecutor in connection with
e tase by’an) y\ @1‘96?’? or persons whom the prosecutor proposes to call to
/0 - give evzd(\,nte\as ah expert withess or withasses; and
7

NS

~ (h) a opy-of any relevant information supplied to the prosecutor by & person
Y 8
@ “Whom the prosecutor considered calling to give evidence as an
}éa\(p/ w‘%fﬂeﬁs ar witnesses, but elected not to do sc.

m riation referrad to above comes into the possession or conirol of the
\ osecutor after full disclosure has been completed and before the trial or
hearing has been completed, the prosecutor must disciose the information to
\/ the defendant as soon as reasonably practicable. You are not required to
record infermation or obtain information for the sole purpose of disciosurs,
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INFORMATION THAT MAY BE WITHHELD

Some information may be withheld from the defendant under Section 14 (2}
if:

(8) the information is not relevant; or
(b) the information may be withheld under saction 15, lﬁg_é Br-18;
or \\

(¢) the reguest appears to be frivolous or \mxatxp@ / \/ s

N

5OV
N - \ )/\7

Information may be withheld under the Crimina /Eﬁ’;cbsure Act @

(@) disclosure of the information is lskely/gg}ejudtce thefm\m ance
of the law, including the preventicn in en a etgzztron of
offences; or / N

(b} disclosure of the mformat:an\sﬁﬂ@/y to ep;dange@;he safety of any
person; or

A~ o
.

(¢) the information is— Q/\ Y \\Q\/\)

(1) material that i 5 prepared by or }@M}se prosecutor to assist
the conduczt @T‘the hearmg@\f\,tua{;or

(i a c;eSm n@aﬁon déélmg\vx\:% matters relating to the
condgct\ v&e prossy lon-and is between—

(N ) the s cqtor and another person employed by the
N \ < dsamei n\or/agerscy that employs the prosecutor: or

N (\/ (B)ﬁk

{a/ lytical or evalliative material prepared, in connection with an
\e/tlgatson\ﬁwai d to the defendant being charged, by a person

rosecutor and any adviser to the prosecutor; or

f/ 9 eépioyed\\b‘y\a;aerson or agency for another person employed by that
\/ persqn\oz‘ ag\ ency or for the prosecutor: or

\/>\/ (ﬁ()‘tﬁg.\ nﬁormatlon s subject to sections 108 and 109 of the Evidence

\Q ’t\Z@GG (Which relates to information about undercover police
gcers

(e) the information Is subject to a pre-trial witness anonymity order

«/z > under section 110 of the Evidence Act 2006 or a witness anonymity
/ /«\\\\) order under section 112 of the Evidence Act 2006; or

(f) the information is subject to section 16 of the Victims Rights Act
2002 (which relates to information about witnesses’ addresses); or

(g) the disclosure of the information would be likely to prejudice—

(1} the security or defence of New Zealand or the international
relations of the Government of New Zealand: or
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(i) the entrusting of information to the Government of New
Zealand on a basis of confidence by the government of any
other country or any agency of such a government or any
international organisation; or

(h) disclosure of the information wouid be likely to faciiitate the
commission of another offence; or

(i) disclosure of the information wouid constitute conter Q/{/ ot or
confempt of the House of Reprasentatives; or SN,

under the rules of evidence; or
(k) disclosure of the information would be c;aﬂr:g(to the prov%aoms of

any other enactment; or \
T 0

(1) the information is publicly avaitable @ ALls reasgnabw D 9ct|cable

for the defendant to obtain the tnfmm%tmfrom other seurce; or

(m) the information has prewmﬂs?\;@be&ﬁ/mad/e aﬁ“ﬂa e to the
defendant; or CTTNY \\7

N

(n) the information ﬂoesmo?;}exrst/or caﬂn@t\bw\fp)unci or
(0) the mrormamon—-ﬂ T / / \\>

{i} reﬂec;% £ thje\crndlbli@\éf/gwftness who is not to be called
by the prosecutor to gwmgtdamce but who may be calied by
the de a’/a,gb tog /ve ENLJHEE and

(HQ ﬁt for any. 8;}/ ¢ reason relevant.

(2} If part cﬁ; Cof info maﬁ@n ay be withheld, the prosecutor must
make t >reﬁqamder of t‘ﬁ nformiation available if it is possible 1o protect the
withhel /or atzon by de?a n, summary, or otherwise.

KN\CT:H osec:utta( ezpmes aware that there has ceased to be any
stif] £cm for v [’chholding all or part of any information that has been

f\ t?ﬂaeid under “chfwsét the prosecutor must, if the criminal proceedings have
e L notyet FQﬁm\;a’kat:ed disclose that information to the defendant as soon as
N /\reasonat{y p‘acacabie

Trage T'ﬁts may also be withheld under section 18 of the Criminal
rse:fgsure Act 2008,

ere are also restrictions on disciosing certain identifying witnass or
/““‘ informant information, for example their address {residential or postal), email
/\, address, fax number or telephone number. This information may oniy be
\/ disclosed with the consent of the witness or informant, or with the leave of
the Court. This applies to the informant regardiess of whether the prosecutor
intends to call the informant as a witness,
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If you decide to withhold information you must (as soon as reasonably

praciicable; inform the defendant of that decision and the grounds for
withholding the information unless:

- The information is not held by, in possession of or in control of the
prosecutor, o

- You do not hold the information in the recorded form. N s
//:/jf\ </\\>\\\
\/" Py’ L
ON / (o
DISCLOSURE BY DEFENDANT TO PR@SECE}‘E"% \> A~

Disclosure by defendant to & prosecutor can occur wher}/ﬁ% def\adant has\\aw ~
alibi and/or any other expert avidence. This does not happén\/vmry Dﬁ’fenf bL?E\)

it may happen. / \ \\ >
If the defendant has an alibi, they must d scio /?)e@gtaiis to/c‘ﬁ@\osbcutor
within 14 days after: AN

N
- the defendant pleads not guilty to a dﬂa@br&u/ghtﬁ/uﬁw\ma‘rw

- elacts trial by jury x\; (o \/
- s committed for trial (if the clé\rqe\is laid md}ﬁt@b\\\?‘f

>
If the defendant has evidence to b@g}feﬂ by<ar<s\\ v}:wtness they must,
within 14 days of start of the.frial or deferged\hegﬂ%g, disclose certain details
to the prosecution. ( Q\/\

// \\/ { ‘/ -_‘\\ \\\>

Inspection @@&u‘bfés &w@@d&’f&ndan&

The prosecgt@r\mustj/on raaue\st Hﬁ}:he defendant, allow the defendant to
inspect any exhibitthat 2750 the exhibit list, If the exhibit can be easily
ccple%/ggﬁ ph ated, therm é\prosecutor must disciose a copy of it to the
defen an

A g\mgﬁacﬁon by t?wed stendant may be subject to conditions the prosecutor
ecessw\j;\epsure the security and integrity of the exhibit in
aml/rig/\ts e\vﬁénma! vaiue.

HXSEL%EJRE BY NON-PARTIES

@%&e e?endant may apply to the Court for an order requiring a non-party to

\\
N/

disclosure. An application may be made at any time after the
@rendaﬂt has:

- pleaded not guilty to a charge brought summarily; or
- elected trial by jury under the Summary Proceeding Act 1957; or
- if the information has been laid indictably, been committed for trials.

The defendant may apply to the Court for an order granting a hearing to
determine whether information that is held by a person or agency, other than
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the prosecutor (which in the case Is the Ministry), be disclosed to the
defendant,

The defendant must give a copy of the application for an order to the
prosecutor, and the prosecutor must be allowad reasonable time to make
written submissions to the Court concerning the application.  The Court may

seek and consider written submissions from the person or agencyﬁa t hoids /\
information requested by the defendant, { 5} o :
_\/\,\“\ // / /J

QD N

UNDISCLOSED INFORMATION <[/\\> o

If, during a hearing or trial of a defendant, the court;ﬂgéis%ak evideng V)

should have been disclosed to the other party buf\/{r@ not, the C rtme%
N (‘/\/7 — \\“\\/

- exclude the evidence; or /2/ \N\ @?‘ D
- adjourn the hearing or trial: DL AN
adjourn the hearing or trial, or //\\‘\\// . .

,‘ A
- admit the evidence if it is in the %nteaest\s@ ustice SOy
N\\ NS g <
(‘\{*:} > i\ T
Y TN
< ‘\) > /\\\\:\ %

. .

N\~ NN
CONG RRTUL%Y LONS!!
) SN
You haye\ﬁﬁnw/ji'nishe,d;ttja\g&sc}bsure Module
PN (N
ST h </// o .
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